
 > Noon: Check in to start your adventure with a warm greeting 
by the front office team and a quick boat orientation. 

 > Noon: Start your accommodation with lunch in the main 
restaurant and charge your energy. 

 > Afternoon: Start your exploration journey by visiting the East 
Bank ( Karnak, and Luxor temples) 

 > Evening: Get back to have a luxury à la carte dinner, and 
then enjoy entertainment shows by Tanoura and a belly dancer 
show in the lounge. 

 > Overnight in Luxor 

 

 > Morning: Wake up for a gourmet breakfast buffet of various 
options, then your Egyptologist will accompany you to the west 
bank (Valley of Kings, and Temple of Queen Hatshepsut). 

 > Morning: Pass by the Famed Colossi while getting back on 
board. 

 > Noon: Enjoy the view with lunch in the main restaurant while 
sailing to Esna then Edfu. 

 > Afternoon: relish with tea time while watching the sunset in 
the fresh air. 

 > Evening: The crew will invite you to have a drink in the 
lounge bar with soft music in the background. 

 > Evening: The à la carte dinner will be waiting for you in the 
main restaurant. 

 > Overnight in Edfu 

 

 > Morning: Have an open buffet breakfast with the view, then 
explore Edfu Temple once you arrive there by horse carriage.. 

 > Morning: Get back for an open buffet breakfast, to find the 
executive chef welcoming you to join a cooking class. 

 > Noon: After enjoying cooking class, Lunch time comes with a 
variety of perfectly cooked items. 

 > Afternoon: post lunch, enjoy having ice cream on the top 
deck while sailing, and have a cup of tea while enjoying the 
golden sunrays. 



 > Evening: you will get the chance to explore Kom Ombo 
temple, then get back to have à la carte dinner followed by a 
Galabia party in the lounge. 

 > Overnight in Aswan 

 

 > Morning: With the glamorous sunlight, delightfully enjoy the 
open buffet breakfast. 

 > Noon: Relish lunch in the main restaurant. 

 > Afternoon: Get ready to explore Philae Temple by motorboat, 
then the high dam. 

 > Evening: Get back to a fancy à la carte dinner followed by a 
Nubian show in the lounge bar. 

 

> Enjoy your breakfast with the Nile view before you check out at 
8:00 a.m. 

 

 

 

 


